
REPAIR AND SUPPLY 
OF INDUSTRIAL ELECTRONIC EQUIMENT  
NEW IN BOX AND REFURBISHED O
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We suggest to repair your 
equipment. Our approach to this 
service is to treat the elements in 
breakdowns, to replace them, to 
take all the necessary preventive 
measures. The material is then 
cleaned, tested and repackaged. 
 
 

Standard exchange is an 
alternative to the best cost / time 
ratio. We suggest you provide 
refurbished equipment to handle 
your emergency, and upon 
receipt, you will have two weeks 
to return your defective 
equipment. 
 

Refurbished care is the key to 
obsolescence management. We 
offer used equipment completely 
renovated (all preventive 
measures carried out), cleaned, 
tested and guaranteed. 
 
 

During our many buying back, we 
recover customer stocks with 
brand new equipment (sealed by 
the label of the manufacturer) 
and you also offer distributed 
materials brands SCHNEIDER, 
SIEMENS, ALLEN BRADLEY, LEROY 
SOMER, OMRON. 
 
 
 

An ephemeral project? A need for 
programming tools? PLSWISS 
offers you the possibility to 
minimize your investments, to 
rent all the equipment from our 
stock to the week. So, you only 
pay what you consume! 
 
 

As for your car, certain types of 
equipment must be cyclically 
controlled to keep them in the 
best conditions to keep your 
production tool as long as 
possible. PLSWISS conducts 
prevention campaigns on the 
equipment needed to make it 
more reliable. 
 
 

Do you have a fleet of machines 
and wish to obtain a diagnosis of 
obsolescence on the electronic 
part? PLSWISS provides tailor-
made solutions to better identify 
the critical elements and their 
degree of obsolescence to help 
you develop a personalized 
management strategy. 
 
 

This service is a service that 
provides you with long-term 
visibility and responsiveness to 
all critical elements of your 
electronic installations. In the 
form of a contract, we ensure the 
durability of your obsolete 
equipment over the desired 
number of years to avoid 
shortages. 
 

OUR SERVICES 



SIEMENS 

SIMATIC S5 

SIMATIC S7 

SIMATIC S7-1200 | S7-1500 

OPERATOR PANEL – OP – MP – TP 

ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT 

ACCESSORIES AND PROGRAMMING TOOLS 



SIEMENS 

SINUMERIK – 6FC – 6FX 

SIMODRIVE – 6SN 

SIMOREG – 6SE – 6RA 

SIMOVERT MASTERDRIVE – 6SC – 6SE – 6RA 

MICROMASTER – SINAMICS 

PCU 



OMRON – ALSPA – APRIL 

OMRON – PLC & OPERATOR PANEL 

OMRON – DRIVE & SERVODRIVE 

ALSPA – PLC 

APRIL – SERIE PB 

APRIL – SERIE SMC 

APRIL – SERIE APRIL 



TELEMECANIQUE – SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC – MERLIN GERIN 

SERIE 7 – TSX17 – TSX27 – TSX47 – TSX67 – TSX87 – TSX107 

NANO – TSX07 | MICRO – TSX37 | TBX 

TWIDO – TWD | QUANTUM – 140NOE 140CPU | MOMENTUM – 170AA 

PREMIUM – TSX57 

M340 | M580 

ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT 



TELEMECANIQUE – SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC – MERLIN GERIN 

MAGELIS XBTA – XBTB – XBTC – XBTE – XBTF – XBTGK – XBTG 

 MAGELIS XBTH – XBTHM – XBTK – XBTKN – XBTM – XBTV 

MAGELIS XBTGT 

MAGELIS HMISTU – HMIGTO 

MAGELIS HMISTU – HMIGTO 

ACCESSORIES AND PROGRAMMING TOOLS 



TELEMECANIQUE – SCHNEIDER ELECTRIC – MERLIN GERIN 

ALTIVAR – ATV11 – ATV12 – ATV16 – ATV18 – ATV21 – ATV28 – ATV31 – ATV38 – ATV56 – ATV58 – ATV61 – ATV66 – ATV71 

ALTIVAR – ATV12 – ATV212 – ATV312 – ATV600 – ATV900 

ALTISTART – ATS01 – ATS23 – ATS48 

RECTIVAR – RTV04 – RTV54 – RTV64 – RTV74 – RTV84 

STATOVAR – STV | DCV – DCVS 

LEXIUM 17 | LEXIUM 32 



ALLEN BRADLEY – GE FANUC – B&R 

ALLEN BRADLEY – SLC | CONTROLLOGIX 

ALLEN BRADLEY – MICROLOGIX | PLC-5 

ALLEN BRADLEY – PANELVIEW 

ALLEN BRADLEY – BULLETIN 

GE FANUC 

B&R 



LAUER – PROFACE – ESA – YOKOGAWA – PUPITRE DE REMPLACEMENT – PC INDUSTRIEL 

LAUER 

PROFACE 

ESA 

YOKOGAWA 

ERSATZPOSTEN 

INDUSTRIE-PCs 



LEROY SOMER – INDRAMAT – LENZE 

LEROY SOMER – CONTROL TECHNIQUES – EMERSON – CEGELEC ALSPA 

LEROY SOMER – CONTROL TECHNIQUES – EMERSON – CEGELEC ALSPA 

BOSCH REXROTH – INDRAMAT 

BOSCH REXROTH – INDRAMAT 

LENZE 

LENZE 



DANFOSS – NUM – ABB 

DANFOSS 

DANFOSS 

NUM 

NUM 

ABB 

ABB 



PARVEX ELGE – EUROTHERM SSD PARKER – MITSUBISHI – YASKAWA 

PARVEX ELGE 

EUROTHERM SSD PARKER 

EUROTHERM SSD PARKER 

MITSUBISHI 

MITSUBISHI 

YASKAWA 



SEW EURODRIVE – FANUC – KOLLMORGEN – BOSCH 

SEW EURODRIVE 

SEW EURODRIVE 

FANUC 

FANUC 

KOLLMORGEN 

BOSCH 



ABB ROBOTICS – FANUC ROBOTICS – KUKA ROBOTICS 

ABB ROBOTICS 

ABB ROBOTICS 

FANUC ROBOTICS 

FANUC ROBOTICS 

KUKA ROBOTICS 

KUKA ROBOTICS 



Route de l’Ancienne Papeterie 
1723 Marly 
Switzerland 

Contact : Mr Jérémie BICHET 
Phone : +41.(0).76.408.71.79 
Email : plswiss@plswiss.com  

Web : www.plswiss.com  


